Camdenton R-II1 School District
Bids for 2013-2014 School Year
Due June 24, 2013 - 10:00 a.m.

*Kohl
Jackson Wholesale Hiland Dairy | --Last Year’s Bid--
Produce Escalating/ | Central | Escalating/De Hiland Dairy
Co De- Dairy -escalating Escalating/De-
' escalating Bid escalating Bid
Bid
NO BID NO BID
MILK
1% white milk 1 pint 2384 2873 2613
Skim Chocolate Milk Y pint gg’zto .3049 2792
Unflavored skim milk Y pint gg’ff' .2824 2567
Low fat buttermilk Y gallon 1'2?253 2.4538 2.2406
2.8433 Low-fat Low-fat 10.5930
No fat cottage cheese 5# i 10.05
1.4833 Low-fat Low-fat 8.75
No fat sour cream 5# i 9.4464
Individual sour cream | 100 count 10.69 17.6300 16.78
Yogurt — Variety 40z See List .3700 .39
Yogurt — Variety 6 oz. See List .5500 .53
Half & Half Quiart 2'1%%75 3.1788 2.1925
Whipping Cream Quart 4'1‘;2?3 6.4141 5.7714
Crave-a-Latte, Skim Pint No Bid .8494 7977
Strawberry milk, skim Y pint gg’zto .3049 2792
Vanilla milk, skim Y pint No Bid .3049 2792
Unflavored milk, skim |  Pint 9042 N/A
Chocolate milk, skim Pint 102%2% .8382 1885
Strawberry milk, skim Pint 1o/§8ézt N/A 8067
Tea Pint ?;330 .8400 84
Lemonade Pint Zzlgo .7500 81
Lemonade Drink Gallon 1'f§t75 1.83 1.81
Punch Drink Gallon 1'21?:5 1.83 181
Cr_]eese American 160 cut 40.77 Mkt Market Market
Slice 4/5#
Shredded Cheddar 5 pounds 10'741(: tht Market Market

*RECOMMEND for 2013-2014




Bids for 2013-2014 School Year
Due June 24, 2013 - 10:00 a.m.

Camdenton R-II1 School District

--Last Year’s Bid--

Wonder
BREAD PRODUCTS S
(Lebanon)
Whole Grain White Bread, 20 slice 1% |b. 1.08
Whole Grain Wheat Bread, 20 slice 1% |b. 1.08
Whole Grain French Bread, sliced 1 Ib. NA
Whole Grain Texas Toast, 16 slice 1% Ib. 1.05 not wg
Whole Grain Hamburger Buns, 4” Packed 12/1 1.05
Whole Grain Hot Dog Buns, 6” Packed 16/1 1.10
Whole Grain Deli Buns, Hoagie, 6” Packed 8/1 1.08
Jackson = Baki
Produce | Sara OWErs BakiNg | Earthgrains Co. -
BREAD PRODUCTS Co. Lee . rgc;i'eld/ Bimbo Bakeries
Sunrise Bakery BaFt)esv?Ile AR Springfield
Beach
NO
NO BID BID
Whole Grain White Bread, 20 slice | 1% Ib. Wh'ffg\éheat 2zlsgc5es
100% Whole Wheat
Whole Grain Wheat Bread, 20 slice 1% Ib. 21026 1.80
Whole Grain French Bread, sliced 1lb. Whifsl; % NA
. Enriched White
Whole Grain Texas Toast, 16 slice 1% Ib. Wh'f 428 oz 191 sggas
100% Whole Wheat .
Whole Grain Hamburger Buns, 4” Packed 12/1 Zosct2 2.00
100% W|:IO|E Wheat
Whole Grain Hot Dog Buns, 6” Packed 16/1 éﬁgtz 2.00
Whole Grain Deli Buns, Hoagie, 6” | Packed 8/1 Whlitl%gd' 1.80
Whole Grain, HB 3 34" Packed 16/1 2.66

*RECOMMEND for 2013-2014

*PROPANE Firm Bid | Cost per gallon "LaStBTSar’S"
Gasco Propane YES 1.30

MFA Propane YES 1.105 .95
Welch Gas YES 1.39

S & W Propane NO BID

Amerigas NO BID

Includes Annual Pressure Test unless noted.
*TABLE THIS ITEM AT THE 7-8-2013 MTG.



	MFA Propane



